



T 206.245.1700
1191 2nd Avenue, Suite 2000
Seattle, WA 98101-3404
pacificalawgroup.com

Clark County
c/o Taylor Hallvik
Clark County Deputy Prosecuting Attorney
(Civil Division)
Email: Taylor.Hallvik@clark.wa.gov

January 12, 2015
Invoice Number: 21403

BILLING SUMMARY

For Professional Services Rendered and Related Costs through December 31, 2014:

In Reference To: 20132.1
v. C-Tran

Total Professional Services	\$ 4,981.50
Total Costs Advanced	<u>\$ 87.50</u>
Total This Invoice	\$ 5,069.00

Tax Id No. 45-1446871

Wire Instructions
Pacifica Law Group LLP
Account Number 002051613
The Commerce Bank of Washington
601 Union Street, Suite 3600
Seattle, WA 98101
ABA Routing Number: 125008013

Important Notice Regarding Change of Address

Please note the change in mailing address for Pacifica Law Group to
1191 2nd Avenue, Suite 2000, Seattle, WA 98101-3404



Clark County
c/o Taylor Hallvik
Clark County Deputy Prosecuting Attorney
(Civil Division)
Email: Taylor.Hallvik@clark.wa.gov

T 206.245.1700
1191 2nd Avenue, Suite 2000
Seattle, WA 98101-3404
pacificallawgroup.com

January 12, 2015
Invoice Number: 21403

INVOICE

For Professional Services Rendered and Related Costs through December 31, 2014

In Reference To: 20132.1
v. C-Tran

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Init	Description	Hours	Amount
12/11/14	MJS	Review and analyze issues regarding OPMA; telephone conferences with T. Hallvik and C. Home	1.00	335.00
12/15/14	SJ	Review background materials regarding OPMA issues; review legal authority regarding same; draft summary analysis of OPMA issues; draft public records request letter	3.60	1,026.00
12/16/14	SJ	Telephone conference with T. Hallvik regarding possible OPMA litigation; review and revise public records request letter; correspond regarding same with M. Segal	.50	142.50
12/18/14	SJ	Review, revise and finalize letter to C-Tran regarding public records request; telephone conference with T. Hallvik regarding OPMA issues	.50	142.50
12/19/14	MJS	Review and analyze issues and arguments; review meeting video	.80	268.00
12/19/14	SJ	Review information regarding and video of November 18 meeting; discuss legal issues with M. Segal	.80	228.00
12/22/14	MJS	Prepare for and conduct telephone conference with T. Hallvik and Commissioner Madore; review emails following up on same; conference with S. Johnson regarding next steps	1.50	502.50
12/22/14	SJ	Telephone conference with T. Hallvik and D. Madrone regarding facts supporting potential OPMA violations; review video of C-TRAN composition review committee meeting; review legal authority regarding composition committee and waiver of OPMA violations; discuss same with M. Segal	4.30	1,225.50

PACIFICA LAW GROUP LLP

Invoice Number: 21403

January 12, 2015

Date	Init	Description	Hours	Amount
12/29/14	SJ	Finish review of recording of November 18 board composition meeting; review legal issues regarding same; draft memorandum summarizing factual history; review pleadings from declaratory judgment action regarding block veto	2.90	826.50
12/30/14	SJ	Review legal authority regarding potential OPMA violations; draft memorandum analyzing same	1.00	285.00
Total Professional Services				\$ 4,981.50

CLIENT COSTS ADVANCED

Date	Description	Amount
12/29/14	Courttrax, WA Superior Index Clark County	2.50
12/29/14	Courttrax, WA Superior Clark County	2.50
12/29/14	Courttrax, Document Retrieval	82.50
Total Client Costs Advanced		\$ 87.50
Total This Invoice		\$ 5,069.00

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Name	Rate	Hours	Total
Matthew J. Segal	335.00	3.30	1,105.50
Sarah Johnson	285.00	13.60	3,876.00
Total		16.90	\$4,981.50